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When Ian Gregg was just a boy he joined his father at work selling pies from his van to miners’ wives
around Newcastle. Now retired, he can look back on a business that began as a husband-and-wife team in the
1930s, and survived a world war and two major recessions to become our favourite bakery, beloved by
everyone from children to office workers to soldiers overseas.

Ian Gregg led the family firm as it grew, employing generations of families from around Newcastle and then
becoming a public company with bakeries in Scotland and across the North, and now with shops on every
high street. This is a story of extraordinary success, but it is also a triumphant tale of how doing right by your
people makes for great business. Bucking every trend, Greggs have always put their customers, employees
and local communities before quick profits for directors and shareholders. Their astounding record of
charitable works includes hardship grants, an environment fund, sponsorship of the North East Children’s
Cancer run and over £1 million raised annually for Children in Need.

Ian Gregg will donate all of his royalties and Greggs plc will donate all its profits from the sale of this book
to the Greggs Foundation to help fund more Breakfast Clubs for children.
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From reader reviews:

Donald Campbell:

The ability that you get from Bread: The Story of Greggs may be the more deep you rooting the information
that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Bread: The Story of Greggs giving you thrill feeling of reading. The article author conveys
their point in specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the item because the author of
this reserve is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That
makes it easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
suggest you for having this particular Bread: The Story of Greggs instantly.

John Buckner:

The book untitled Bread: The Story of Greggs contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains
your ex idea with easy means. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do definitely not
worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author will take you in the new
time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or
program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-
book, you can open up their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

Gerri Townsend:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our know-how for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended up
being exactly added. This e-book Bread: The Story of Greggs was filled regarding science. Spend your extra
time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has various feel
when they reading a book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can feel enjoy to read a guide.
In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book you wanted.

Mildred Miller:

A number of people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Bread: The Story of Greggs to
make your own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is developing when you such as
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation about book and
examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside that the
e-book Bread: The Story of Greggs can to be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse
using what must you're doing of the time.
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