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The easy way to drive your food truck business to success

A new generation of street food lovers are lining up at food trucks and food carts. Though the idea is a long-
standing part of American and world culture, the street food industry has never enjoyed so much popularity
or publicity. With lower start-up costs than traditional "store front" restaurants, food trucks offer a unique
opportunity to entrepreneurs in a business climate where credit is tight and capital is scarce. In Running a
Food Truck For Dummies, you'll get all the delicious details needed to start your own food truck business
quickly, affordably, and successfully.

Whether you're one for the nearly 3 million owners and operators of existing food truck businesses or a chef,
foodie, or gourmand interested in starting your own mobile restaurant endeavor, Running a Food Truck For
Dummies helps you find your food niche, follow important rules of conducting business on the road, outfit
your moving kitchen, meet safety and sanitation requirements, and much more.

Help starting and creating a business plan●

Advice on creating a mobile menu, choosing and outfitting a vehicle, setting prices, and hiring help●

Everything you need to know about licenses, permits, zoning, parking, and other considerations●

Coverage of using Social Media advertising,such as Facebook and Twitter, to market your food truck●

business

From choosing and outfitting a business vehicle to franchising and everything in between, Running a Food
Truck For Dummies shows foodies everything they need to know to get their business moving toward
success!
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From reader reviews:

Edward Gilbert:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important behave,
like looking for your favorite guide and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Running a Food Truck For Dummies. Try to the actual book Running
a Food Truck For Dummies as your friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone
and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The
book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know every thing by the book. So , we should make
new experience and knowledge with this book.

Cheryl Estrella:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person has
different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great and also important the book Running a Food Truck For Dummies. All
type of book can you see on many sources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Shannon Lynch:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of e-
book you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want
experience happy read one along with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the
Running a Food Truck For Dummies is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Tara Payton:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
you also know that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You must know that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update about something by book.
Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is Running a Food Truck For
Dummies.
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