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While John McPhee was working on his previous book, Rising from the Plains, he happened to walk by the
engineering building at the University of Wyoming, where words etched in limestone said: "Strive on--the
control of Nature is won, not given." In the morning sunlight, that central phrase--"the control of nature"--
seemed to sparkle with unintended ambiguity. Bilateral, symmetrical, it could with equal speed travel in
opposite directions. For some years, he had been planning a book about places in the world where people
have been engaged in all-out battles with nature, about (in the words of the book itself) "any struggle against
natural forces--heroic or venal, rash or well advised--when human beings conscript themselves to fight
against the earth, to take what is not given, to rout the destroying enemy, to surround the base of Mt.
Olympus demanding and expecting the surrender of the gods." His interest had first been sparked when he
went into the Atchafalaya--the largest river swamp in North America--and had learned that virtually all of its
waters were metered and rationed by a U.S. Army Corps of Engineers' project called Old River Control.

In the natural cycles of the Mississippi's deltaic plain, the time had come for the Mississippi to change
course, to shift its mouth more than a hundred miles and go down the Atchafalaya, one of its distributary
branches. The United States could not afford that--for New Orleans, Baton Rouge, and all the industries that
lie between would be cut off from river commerce with the rest of the nation. At a place called Old River, the
Corps therefore had built a great fortress--part dam, part valve--to restrain the flow of the Atchafalaya and
compel the Mississippi to stay where it is.

In Iceland, in 1973, an island split open without warning and huge volumes of lava began moving in the
direction of a harbor scarcely half a mile away. It was not only Iceland's premier fishing port (accounting for
a large percentage of Iceland's export economy) but it was also the only harbor along the nation's southern
coast. As the lava threatened to fill the harbor and wipe it out, a physicist named Thorbjorn Sigurgeirsson
suggested a way to fight against the flowing red rock--initiating an all-out endeavor unique in human history.
On the big island of Hawaii, one of the world's two must eruptive hot spots, people are not unmindful of the
Icelandic example. McPhee went to Hawaii to talk with them and to walk beside the edges of a molten lake
and incandescent rivers.

Some of the more expensive real estate in Los Angeles is up against mountains that are rising and
disintegrating as rapidly as any in the world. After a complex coincidence of natural events, boulders will
flow out of these mountains like fish eggs, mixed with mud, sand, and smaller rocks in a cascading mass
known as debris flow. Plucking up trees and cars, bursting through doors and windows, filling up houses to
their eaves, debris flows threaten the lives of people living in and near Los Angeles' famous canyons. At
extraordinary expense the city has built a hundred and fifty stadium-like basins in a daring effort to catch the
debris.

Taking us deep into these contested territories, McPhee details the strategies and tactics through which
people attempt to control nature. Most striking in his vivid depiction of the main contestants: nature in
complex and awesome guises, and those who would attempt to wrest control from her--stubborn, often
ingenious, and always arresting characters.
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From reader reviews:

Roberta Petty:

The event that you get from The Control of Nature could be the more deep you excavating the information
that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to
understand but The Control of Nature giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in a
number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the item because the author of this book is
well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. That makes it
easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We advise you for
having that The Control of Nature instantly.

Scott Lowe:

This book untitled The Control of Nature to be one of several books that best seller in this year, this is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too.
It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is
no reason to you to past this guide from your list.

Brianna Bell:

Beside that The Control of Nature in your phone, it might give you a way to get closer to the new knowledge
or information. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so don't
always be worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have The Control
of Nature because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you at times have book but you
rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this inside your
hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you
still want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from now!

Anthony Koch:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or even make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their pastime. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know that
on this age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this The Control of Nature can make you sense more interested to read.
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