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Jeremy's third amazing voyage is on Captain Cook's famous ships—the Endeavour and the Resolution—to
Antarctica, Vancouver Island, Australia, and Hawaii.

It all started when Jeremy opened his grandfather's old stamp album. He picked up a magnifying glass for a
quick look—at a beautiful stamp bearing the painting of a ship—and the next thing he knew he was standing
on its deck! He had found an incredible way to travel through time and distance and soon experienced many
wonderful adventures.

Now Jeremy's life may change. His father has remarried and wants Jeremy to come and visit him and his
new wife. Jeremy doesn't know how this will change his life. Things may be difficult in the everyday world,
but Jeremy has another place he can go—to the beautiful sailing ships on his stamps.

His new adventure takes him to some of the world's most exciting places, in the company of one of the
greatest explorers—the stormy seas near Antarctica; the shores of Australia and Hawaii; and as far north as
Vancouver Island. Jeremy meets many dangers that test his character, and he even meets his own grandson, a
time traveler from the future!

Cora Taylor is one of Canada's best-known children's authors. She has published more than a dozen
juvenile novels. Cora's Coteau titles include the very successful Ghost Voyages series and the Spy Who
Wasn't There series, which includes Adventures in Istanbul and Murder in Mexico as well as her latest book,
Chaos in China.
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From reader reviews:

Fred Howell:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yeah, you can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare
time to take a walk, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled
Ghost Voyages 3: Endeavour & Resolution? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have different opinion?

Stacy Perry:

The book untitled Ghost Voyages 3: Endeavour & Resolution contain a lot of information on it. The writer
explains your ex idea with easy technique. The language is very easy to understand all the people, so do not
really worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was published by famous author. The author will bring
you in the new era of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can continue reading your
smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice learn.

Kenneth Leishman:

You are able to spend your free time to learn this book this guide. This Ghost Voyages 3: Endeavour &
Resolution is simple to create you can read it in the park your car, in the beach, train along with soon. If you
did not have much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you
simpler to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when you buy this book.

Joan Davis:

Beside this Ghost Voyages 3: Endeavour & Resolution in your phone, it could give you a way to get more
close to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh
from your oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow village. It is
good thing to have Ghost Voyages 3: Endeavour & Resolution because this book offers for you readable
information. Do you oftentimes have book but you seldom get what it's about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the idea? Find this book along with read it from
currently!
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