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From the publisher of Farrar, Straus and Giroux: a first novel, at once hilarious and tender, about the
decades-long rivalry between two publishing lions, and the iconic, alluring writer who has obsessed them
both.

Paul Dukach is heir apparent at Purcell & Stern, one of the last independent publishing houses in New York,
whose shabby offices on Union Square belie the treasures on its list. Working with his boss, the flamboyant
Homer Stern, Paul learns the ins and outs of the book trade—how to work an agent over lunch; how to swim
with the literary sharks at the Frankfurt Book Fair; and, most important, how to nurse the fragile egos of the
dazzling, volatile authors he adores.

But Paul’s deepest admiration has always been reserved for one writer: poet Ida Perkins, whose audacious
verse and notorious private life have shaped America’s contemporary literary landscape, and whose longtime
publisher—also her cousin and erstwhile lover—happens to be Homer’s biggest rival. And when Paul at last
has the chance to meet Ida at her Venetian palazzo, she entrusts him with her greatest secret—one that will
change all of their lives forever.

Studded with juicy details only a quintessential insider could know, written with both satiric verve and
openhearted nostalgia, Muse is a brilliant, haunting book about the beguiling interplay between life and art,
and the eternal romance of literature.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Willie Clark:

The book Muse: A novel give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having
big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book Muse: A novel for being your habit, you
can get far more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects.
You are able to know everything if you like open and read a book Muse: A novel. Kinds of book are several.
It means that, science book or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Amanda Furr:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you require
something to explain what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to try and do others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They should answer that question simply
because just their can do in which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that Muse: A novel to read.

Helen Jackson:

This Muse: A novel is great guide for you because the content that is certainly full of information for you
who have always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it facts
accurately using great coordinate word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read
the idea hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward
sentences but hard core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Muse: A novel in your hand
like keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no e-book that offer you
world inside ten or fifteen moment right but this reserve already do that. So , this is good reading book. Heya
Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in which?

Pearl Minjares:

You will get this Muse: A novel by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can
to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only
through written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era just like now,
you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your
current ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately
make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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