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In a time when libraries have to face constant change, this book provides examples and advises on how to
lead when change is needed (for example, when quality management is implemented or when libraries have
to merge or to relocate). Engaging with how constant change affects leadership in libraries and how leaders
in libraries act in times of change, this book is aimed at practitioners and students of Library and Information
Science (LIS) alike, and is based on both theory and expert interviews from leaders in academic and public
libraries that are in the midst, or are now coming out of a process of change.

Provides practical solutions for real change situations and problems in libraries●

Includes expert interviews●

Written by a professor with nine years experience as a member the management team for the German●

National Library of Science and Technology
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From reader reviews:

Guadalupe Winn:

As people who live in the modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even knowledge to
make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Leadership in Academic and
Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information Professional Series) is our recommendation to
cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Richard Davy:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name Leadership
in Academic and Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information Professional Series) suitable to
you? The particular book was written by well known writer in this era. The actual book untitled Leadership
in Academic and Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information Professional Series)is the one of
several books this everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you
read this book you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The author explained their
concept in the simple way, consequently all of people can easily to know the core of this reserve. This book
will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world
with this book.

Bertie Lewis:

The actual book Leadership in Academic and Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information
Professional Series) will bring that you the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to
describe the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The
book Leadership in Academic and Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information Professional
Series) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you
can quickly to read the book.

Marlys Wieland:

Typically the book Leadership in Academic and Public Libraries: A Time of Change (Chandos Information
Professional Series) has a lot details on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The
book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some research just before write this book.
This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after scanning this book.
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