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From a shy small-town girl singing for family and friends at community concerts, to the bright lights of
country music fame, from the wheelhouse of her very own fishing vessel hundreds of miles offshore, to the
summit of Mount Kilimanjaro in whiteout conditions, from journalist to entrepreneur to broadcaster to TV
show host, Sabrina Whyatt has clearly donned many hats and blazed many a trail.

The Woman I Am is a story of unwavering ambition to rise to one’s full potential. It’s a story of the vital
love and support of family, the exceptional, exclusive moors of small-town Newfoundland, and the sundry,
winding roads that gratefully lead us back home.

But no success story ever unfolds without its share of tribulations, setbacks, and personal struggles.

The Woman I Am is Sabrina’s unflinching, appreciative, often hilarious and ultimately courageous story of
the pursuit of self-discovery and inner sanctuary, and it’s told with that same generous spirit that’s made her
one of Newfoundland and Labrador’s most recognizable and esteemed personalities.
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From reader reviews:

Adam Whittington:

Inside other case, little men and women like to read book The Woman I Am. You can choose the best book if
you want reading a book. As long as we know about how is important any book The Woman I Am. You can
add expertise and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from
book you can learn everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you may be known.
About simple matter until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, you can open a book as well
as searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel bored to go to the library.
Let's read.

Cedric Baker:

Book will be written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve The Woman I Am will make you
to always be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some of you
think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they could be thought
like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Herman Deans:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even an issue. What people must be
consider any time those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you find
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take The Woman I Am as your daily resource information.

Linda Young:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love The Woman I Am, you are
able to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it?
Oh occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its named reading friends.
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