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Someone’s out to get Sherry’s stepmom. . . .Can she save her before it’s too late?

Did you know that the main campus of the Academy of Spirits is at a Dairy Queen in Phoenix? Me either.
Until now. Some weird stuff has been happening to my stepmother, Paula, and the Academy has asked me,
Sherry Holmes Baldwin, to get to the bottom of it. They think someone’s trying to hurt her.

I really don’t want to get involved—my life is way too busy. Josh and I are celebrating two blissful months
of togetherness. And my best friend, Junie, is finally showing a teeny bit of interest in clothes and makeup
after years of brainiac behavior. But being that my mom is a ghost and all, me, my brother, and my dad rely
on Paula a lot. So it’s not like I can just ignore what’s going on. Especially since my mom is competing at
the Ghostlympics. If she comes in first place, she earns five minutes of Real Time.

And that means I’ve got to get involved in a creepy, freaky mystery.

But . . . I so don’t do spooky.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Leticia Brewster:

What do you consider book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something
that they don't desire do that. You must know how great as well as important the book I So Don't Do Spooky
(I So Don't Do...). All type of book would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions
or other social media.

Martha Albarado:

Beside this particular I So Don't Do Spooky (I So Don't Do...) in your phone, it could possibly give you a
way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is
fresh through the oven so don't become worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good
thing to have I So Don't Do Spooky (I So Don't Do...) because this book offers to your account readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's interesting features of. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable,
like treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from
now!

Alissa Sowell:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This I So Don't Do Spooky (I So Don't Do...) can
give you a lot of friends because by you investigating this one book you have point that they don't and make
you more like an interesting person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This e-book offer
you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than various other make you to
be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have I So Don't Do Spooky (I So Don't Do...).

Wanda Hardin:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that issue
was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you know
that little person such as reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by
book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is this I So
Don't Do Spooky (I So Don't Do...).
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