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"C'era in Antonia qualcosa che la rendeva diversa dalle altre persone. Era come se a lei importasse poco di
vivere o morire." La vita e l'apprendistato nel terrorismo della brigatista Antonia raccontata sia attraverso i
ricordi, spesso confusi, della sorella Emma, sia attraverso le indagini della polizia.
Antonia Rossetti è giovane, è bella, ha un bambino di pochi giorni eppure decide di abbandonare tutto ed
entrare in clandestinità. Cosa la spinge a compiere un gesto così estremo e definitivo? Sullo sfondo di una
Genova attraversata da inquietudini e sospetti, la vita di Antonia diventa il simbolo di una gioventù disperata
e disorientata che non ha più nulla da perdere.
Spaccato drammatico degli anni di piombo, Come torrenti di pioggia è un romanzo dove verità e menzogna
apparentemente non hanno confine e s'intrecciano in un groviglio inestricabile sino all'inevitabile, tragica,
conclusione.
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From reader reviews:

Juan Palmer:

Now a day those who Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How a lot more to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information especially this Come torrenti di pioggia (Italian
Edition) book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred
per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Kelly Neidig:

The book untitled Come torrenti di pioggia (Italian Edition) contain a lot of information on that. The writer
explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do not
really worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was compiled by famous author. The author gives you
in the new period of literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can please read on your smart
phone, or program, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-
book, you can wide open their official web-site and order it. Have a nice go through.

Rebecca Walton:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this book. This Come torrenti di pioggia (Italian
Edition) is simple to bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did
not have got much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you quicker
to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.

Jean McCallum:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library
in order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's soul or
real their passion. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring in addition to can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Come torrenti di pioggia (Italian Edition) can make you really feel more interested
to read.
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