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From Book 1: “Charming characters, emotion galore, a small town—you’re going to love Donna
Kauffman!” —Lori Foster

In seaside Blueberry Cove, Maine, friends are just another word for family, and big-city politics take a
backseat to local pride. But the real treasure on these shores is always love…

When D.C. lawyer Hannah McCrae heads home for her brother’s wedding, she’s dragging a lot of baggage
along with her—and she doesn’t mean suitcases. Betrayed personally, and humiliated professionally, the last
thing she wants is a new man. That’s fine with square-jawed, rugged contractor Calder Blue. He and Hannah
may be wildly attracted to one another, but all he wants is to build the town’s hotly contested new yacht club
and mend a centuries-old family feud. Yet thanks to resentments old and new, day after day the pair wind up
tangled in each other’s business—and maybe soon in each other’s arms.

Every bride needs something “blue”…

Includes a delicious wedding cake recipe!
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From reader reviews:

George Oneal:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the publication entitled The Brides of Blueberry Cove Series (3 Book Series). Try to
stumble through book The Brides of Blueberry Cove Series (3 Book Series) as your pal. It means that it can
for being your friend when you feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it
is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know
every little thing by the book. So , let us make new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Anthony Anderson:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
Yes, you can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a walk, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book titled The Brides of
Blueberry Cove Series (3 Book Series)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You recognize beside
you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its
opinion or you have additional opinion?

Jeffrey Evans:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-book. Book
has a different type. As you may know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A book The Brides of Blueberry Cove Series (3 Book Series)
will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about anything.
But some of you think this open or reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they are often
thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited book with you?

Clifford Hudgins:

You will get this The Brides of Blueberry Cove Series (3 Book Series) by look at the bookstore or Mall.
Only viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds
of this reserve are various. Not only by means of written or printed but can you enjoy this book through e-
book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their
problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose correct
ways for you.
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