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San Diego's North Island is one of the most significant venues of aviation in the world. Starting in 1911, it
was the home to one of the nation's first aviation schools, founded by Glenn Curtiss, who pioneered seaplane
flight. He trained the nucleus of America's future air forces there, including Lt. Theodore Ellyson, the first
naval aviator. When the United States entered World War I, the government took over the island with plans
to build a training center for the nation's armed forces. The new army base was named Rockwell Field, and
the navy portion was named Naval Air Station San Diego. By 1937, the army had moved out, and the navy
became the sole tenant. Today NAS North Island is part of the largest aerospace-industrial complex in the
navy and is headquarters for the Naval Air Force, U.S. Pacific Fleet.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Burritt:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book entitled San
Diego's North Island: 1911-1941 (CA) (Images of Aviation)? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You
understand beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do
you agree with it is opinion or you have some other opinion?

Susan Scott:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this San Diego's North Island: 1911-1941 (CA)
(Images of Aviation) e-book written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who have read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
producing skill only for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation San Diego's North
Island: 1911-1941 (CA) (Images of Aviation) as good book not just by the cover but also from the content.
This is one publication that can break don't assess book by its include, so do you still needing an additional
sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already told you so why you have to listening
to another sixth sense.

Eric Beckman:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to study a book. When you
examine a book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
simply because book has a lot of information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. In order to get information about your examine, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, and also soon. The
San Diego's North Island: 1911-1941 (CA) (Images of Aviation) will give you a new experience in
examining a book.

Robert King:

Is it you who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This San Diego's North Island: 1911-1941 (CA)
(Images of Aviation) can be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this completely new era is common not a geek activity.
So what these guides have than the others?
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