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Throughout our history, humans have been captivated by mythic beasts and legendary creatures. Tales of
Bigfoot, the Yeti, and the Loch Ness monster are part of our collective experience. Now comes a book from
two dedicated investigators that explores and elucidates the fascinating world of cryptozoology. Daniel
Loxton and Donald R. Prothero have written an entertaining, educational, and definitive text on cryptids,
presenting the arguments both for and against their existence and systematically challenging the
pseudoscience that perpetuates their myths. After examining the nature of science and pseudoscience and
their relation to cryptozoology, Loxton and Prothero take on Bigfoot; the Yeti, or Abominable Snowman,
and its cross-cultural incarnations; the Loch Ness monster and its highly publicized sightings; the evolution
of the Great Sea Serpent; and Mokele Mbembe, or the Congo dinosaur. They conclude with an analysis of
the psychology behind the persistent belief in paranormal phenomena, identifying the major players in
cryptozoology, discussing the character of its subculture, and considering the challenge it poses to clear and
critical thinking in our increasingly complex world.
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From reader reviews:

Olive Wilson:

This Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and Other Famous Cryptids book is just not ordinary
book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper anyone read a lot
of information you will get. This specific Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and Other
Famous Cryptids without we understand teach the one who reading it become critical in contemplating and
analyzing. Don't always be worry Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and Other Famous
Cryptids can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you
can have it in the lovely laptop even telephone. This Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and
Other Famous Cryptids having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not experience
uninterested in reading.

Iris Robertson:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to make
them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and make progress. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This Abominable Science!: Origins of
the Yeti, Nessie, and Other Famous Cryptids is our recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why,
since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Linda Amato:

This book untitled Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and Other Famous Cryptids to be one
of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this publication you can
get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it by
means of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book,
because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this
reserve from your list.

Andrea Winburn:

You can find this Abominable Science!: Origins of the Yeti, Nessie, and Other Famous Cryptids by browse
the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to
your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed but in addition can
you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your mobile
phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about
your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's
try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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