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Ema was in a bad situation with a married man. She was visiting him in Washington, D.C. His wife was out
of town. He had gotten them an outrageously expensive hotel room, out of respect for his wife and their
home. Ema took that as a sign of his decency, and as a sign of her doom.

So begins "The Real Sloane Newman," one of the stories in Amie Barrodale's debut collection, You Are
Having a Good Time. In these highly compressed and charged tales, the veneer of normality is stripped from
her characters' lives to reveal the seething and contradictory desires that fuel them. In "Animals," an up-and-
coming starlet harbors a complicated attraction toward her abusive director. In "Frank Advice for Fat
Women," an ethically compromised psychiatrist is drawn into the middle of a dysfunctional mother-daughter
relationship. And in "The Imp," a supernatural possession ruins a man's relationship with his pregnant wife.

Barrodale's protagonists drink too much, say the wrong things, want the wrong people. They're hounded by
longings (and sometimes ghosts) to the point where they are forced to confront the illusions they cling to.
They're brought to life in stories that don't behave as you expect stories to behave. Barrodale's startlingly
funny and original fictions get under your skin and make you reconsider the fragile compromises that
underpin our daily lives.
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From reader reviews:

Katy Pinkham:

The ability that you get from You Are Having a Good Time: Stories could be the more deep you digging the
information that hide in the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this
book is hard to be aware of but You Are Having a Good Time: Stories giving you thrill feeling of reading.
The author conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read the
idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your current vocabulary
increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book
style are available. We highly recommend you for having that You Are Having a Good Time: Stories
instantly.

Stephanie Wilkes:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information presently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
when those information which is inside the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which
one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take You Are Having a Good Time: Stories as the daily resource
information.

Kenneth Hoy:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love You Are Having a Good
Time: Stories, you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang
type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.

James Crist:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find reserve
that need more time to be go through. You Are Having a Good Time: Stories can be your answer mainly
because it can be read by you who have those short spare time problems.
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