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In the most original and ambitious synthesis yet undertaken in Melanesian scholarship, Marilyn Strathern
argues that gender relations have been a particular casualty of unexamined assumptions held by Western
anthropologists and feminist scholars alike. The book treats with equal seriousness—and with equal good
humor—the insights of Western social science, feminist politics, and ethnographic reporting, in order to
rethink the representation of Melanesian social and cultural life. This makes The Gender of the Gift one of
the most sustained critiques of cross-cultural comparison that anthropology has seen, and one of its most
spirited vindications.
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From reader reviews:

Steve Duran:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Studying a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Gender of the Gift: Problems with
Women and Problems with Society in Melanesia (Studies in Melanesian Anthropology) book as this book
offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred pct guarantees
there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Catherine Benavidez:

The event that you get from The Gender of the Gift: Problems with Women and Problems with Society in
Melanesia (Studies in Melanesian Anthropology) is a more deep you searching the information that hide in
the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to be aware of but
The Gender of the Gift: Problems with Women and Problems with Society in Melanesia (Studies in
Melanesian Anthropology) giving you joy feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in
particular way that can be understood through anyone who read the item because the author of this e-book is
well-known enough. This particular book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy
to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you
for having that The Gender of the Gift: Problems with Women and Problems with Society in Melanesia
(Studies in Melanesian Anthropology) instantly.

John Keaney:

The book untitled The Gender of the Gift: Problems with Women and Problems with Society in Melanesia
(Studies in Melanesian Anthropology) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy means. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not
necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was published by famous author. The author gives you
in the new period of time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can read on your smart
phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you
can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice study.

Megan Jordan:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got pupils? We believe that that query was
given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also know
that little person just like reading or as studying become their hobby. You should know that reading is very
important as well as book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
current teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. A substantial



number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims The Gender
of the Gift: Problems with Women and Problems with Society in Melanesia (Studies in Melanesian
Anthropology).
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