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Contemporary teen fiction with a twist!

Felicity St. John has it all: loyal best friends, a hot guy, and artistic talent. And she’s right on track to win the
Miss Scarlet pageant. Her perfect life is possible because of just one thing: her long, wavy, coppery red hair.

Having red hair is all that matters in Scarletville. Redheads hold all the power—and everybody knows it.
That’s why Felicity is scared down to her roots when she receives an anonymous note:
I know your secret.

Because Felicity is a big fake. Her hair color comes straight out of a bottle. And if anyone discovered the
truth, she’d be a social outcast faster than she could say strawberry blond. Her mother would disown her, her
friends would shun her, and her boyfriend would dump her. And forget about winning that pageant crown
and the prize money that comes with it—money that would allow her to fulfill her dream of going to art
school.

Felicity isn’t about to let someone blackmail her life away. But just how far is she willing to go to protect her
red cred?

“As thought-provoking as it is enchanting.”—Rae Carson, author of the FIRE AND THORNS trilogy
 
 “Smart, funny, and full of Awesome Ladies Behaving Awesomely, Alison Cherry's RED is everything I
look for in a book. It will make you laugh, it will make you think, and it will make you book an appointment
with your colorist immediately."
—Rachel Hawkins, New York Times bestselling author of the Hex Hall series

“Clever, wickedly funny and with so much heart.”—Melina Marchetta, author of the Printz-award winning
Jellicoe Road

 “Sparkles with wit.”—Publishers Weekly
 
“A really strong commentary on superficiality and social standing.”–School Library Journal
 
 
“This may challenge readers to reconsider how they define beauty—and perhaps give them the confidence to
question a pecking order or two.”—Booklist

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Virginia Glass:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Red is our recommendation to make you
keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Paul Howell:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the name Red
suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well known writer in this era. The particular book untitled
Redis a single of several books that everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the
world. When you read this publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know previous to. The
author explained their thought in the simple way, so all of people can easily to understand the core of this
publication. This book will give you a great deal of information about this world now. To help you to see the
represented of the world within this book.

Christine Hook:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, gonna beach, or
picnic inside the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to
fill your free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book might be option to fill your no cost time/ holiday. The
first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test look for book,
may be the reserve untitled Red can be very good book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Ann Potter:

This Red is great book for you because the content which is full of information for you who all always deal
with world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal it info accurately using great arrange
word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole
details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but tricky core information with
wonderful delivering sentences. Having Red in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous a single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen moment right but this
guide already do that. So , it is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt which?
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