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There's something out there…

"Iceland's answer to Stieg Larsson."

--Daily Telegraph

"Iceland's crime queen."

--The Scotsman

"Engaging, fresh, and exciting."

--James Patterson

Yrsa Sigurdardóttir is widely regarded around the world as one of the best Nordic crime writers working
today. Yrsa's previous book in the series, Ashes to Dust, also featured lawyer and sometime sleuth Thóra
Gudmundsdóttir and received rave reviews internationally.

In The Day is Dark, when all contact is lost with two Icelanders working in a harsh and sparsely populated
area on the coast of Greenland, Thóra is hired to uncover the fates of the missing people. When she arrives in
Greenland, she discovers that these aren't the first two to go missing. The local townspeople believe that the
area is cursed, and no one wants to get involved in the case. Soon, Thora finds herself stranded in the middle
of a wilderness, and the case is as frightening and hostile as the landscape itself.
Chilling, unsettling, and compulsively readable, The Day is Dark is a must read for readers who are looking
for the next big thing in crime fiction coming in from the cold.
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From reader reviews:

Ernestine Miller:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a move, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed The Day Is Dark:
A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You already know
beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it
has the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Latoya Brown:

This The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) book is just not ordinary book, you have
after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is actually information
inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of
information you will get. This specific The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) without
we comprehend teach the one who looking at it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be
worry The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) can bring when you are and not make
your bag space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even
phone. This The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) having good arrangement in word
and layout, so you will not sense uninterested in reading.

Mary Jones:

This The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) usually are reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The reason of this The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir
Book 4) can be on the list of great books you must have is actually giving you more than just simple studying
food but feed you with information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you
can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed kinds. Beside
that this The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) giving you an enormous of experience
such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So ,
let's have it appreciate reading.

David Bostick:

The e-book untitled The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4) is the guide that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to anyone. The
language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Day Is Dark: A Thriller (Thora Gudmundsdottir Book 4)
from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.
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