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A nonfiction legal thriller that traces the fourteen-year struggle of two lawyers to bring the most
powerful coal baron in American history, Don Blankenship, to justice

Don Blankenship, head of Massey Energy since the early 1990s, ran an industry that provides nearly half of
America's electric power. But wealth and influence weren't enough for Blankenship and his company, as
they set about destroying corporate and personal rivals, challenging the Constitution, purchasing the West
Virginia judiciary, and willfully disregarding safety standards in the company's mines?in which scores died
unnecessarily.

As Blankenship hobnobbed with a West Virginia Supreme Court justice in France, his company polluted the
drinking water of hundreds of citizens while he himself fostered baroque vendettas against anyone who dared
challenge his sovereignty over coal mining country. Just about the only thing that stood in the way of
Blankenship's tyranny over a state and an industry was a pair of odd-couple attorneys, Dave Fawcett and
Bruce Stanley, who undertook a legal quest to bring justice to this corner of America. From the backwoods
courtrooms of West Virginia they pursued their case all the way to the U.S. Supreme Court, and to a
dramatic decision declaring that the wealthy and powerful are not entitled to purchase their own brand of
law.

The Price of Justice is a story of corporate corruption so far-reaching and devastating it could have been
written a hundred years ago by Ida Tarbell or Lincoln Steffens. And as Laurence Leamer demonstrates in
this captivating tale, because it's true, it's scarier than fiction.
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From reader reviews:

Gemma Jackson:

The book The Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption can give more knowledge and
information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave a very important thing like a book The
Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption? Wide variety you have a different opinion about
guide. But one aim which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer
using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you are able to give for each other; you could
share all of these. Book The Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption has simple shape
however you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by wide open
and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Arthur Atwood:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be read.
The Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption can be your answer since it can be read by you
actually who have those short extra time problems.

Joseph Fulkerson:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book The Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption was filled
concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has several feel when they reading a book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can
feel enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Peter Chatman:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media
social like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the The Price of Justice: A True Story of Greed and Corruption when you desired it?
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