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The increasing world population, competition for arable land and rich fishing grounds, and environmental
concerns mandate that we exploit in a sustainable way the earth’s available plant and animal resources for
human consumption. To that end, food chemists, technologists, and nutritionists engage in a vast number of
tasks related to food availability, quality, safety, nutritional value, and sensory properties—as well as those
involved in processing, storage, and distribution. To assist in these functions, it is essential they have easy
access to a collection of information on the myriad compounds found in foods. This is particularly true
because even compounds present in minute concentrations may exert significant desirable or negative effects
on foods.

Includes a foreword by Zdzislaw E. Sikorski, Gda?sk University of Technology, Poland; Editor of the CRC
Press Chemical & Functional Properties of Food Components Series.

Dictionary of Food Compounds, Second Edition is presented in a user-friendly format in both hard copy and
fully searchable CD-ROM. It contains entries describing natural components of food raw materials and
products as well as compounds added to foods or formed in the course of storage or processing. Each entry
contains the name of the component, the chemical and physical characteristics, a description of functional
properties related to food use, and nutritional and toxicological data. Ample references facilitate inquiry into
more detailed information about any particular compound.

Food Compounds Covered:

Natural Food Constituents
Lipids
Proteins
Carbohydrates
Fatty acids
Flavonoids
Alkaloids
Food Contaminants
Mycotoxins
Food Additives



Colorants
Preservatives
Antioxidants
Flavors
Nutraceuticals
Probiotics
Dietary Supplements
Vitamins

This new edition boasts an additional 12,000 entries for a total of 41,000 compounds, including 900 enzymes
found in food. No other reference work on food compounds is as complete or as comprehensive.
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From reader reviews:

Luis Gray:

Here thing why this kind of Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition are different and
reliable to be yours. First of all studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of computer
which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second
Edition giving you information deeper including different ways, you can find any book out there but there is
no publication that similar with Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition. It gives you
thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably
can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your
approach home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the published book maybe the form of
Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition in e-book can be your substitute.

Kevin Jakubowski:

This Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition are reliable for you who want to
certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-
ROM, Second Edition can be on the list of great books you must have will be giving you more than just
simple looking at food but feed you actually with information that maybe will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book
and printed ones. Beside that this Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition forcing
you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could
it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Steven Bourg:

Beside this Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition in your phone, it can give you a
way to get more close to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you might got here
is fresh in the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is
good thing to have Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition because this book offers
to you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh
come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this inside your hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here
cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss it? Find this book
along with read it from currently!

Gay Swiderski:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may have it
in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This kind of Dictionary of Food Compounds with CD-ROM,
Second Edition can give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have factor that
they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step
for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be your friend doesn't recognize, by



knowing more than some other make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have Dictionary
of Food Compounds with CD-ROM, Second Edition.
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