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This book explores the inherent conflict between the philosophical concept of the rule of law on one hand
and sovereign immunity as it exists in the United States today on the other. The volume begins by canvassing
the development of sovereignty as a concept from Bodin in the sixteenth century through the Framers of the
United States Constitution in the late eighteenth century. The philosophy of John Locke receives special
emphasis because the Framers were so intellectually indebted to his then-revolutionary view of sovereignty
as an attribute of the people, not the government and of government not as the people's master, but as their
trustee bound to perform on their behalf. An examination of sovereign immunity in the United States
follows, focusing on the federalism relationship between the United States and the individual states. The
Supreme Court's recent development of federalism, referred to by many as the New Federalism, provides
rich material with which to examine sovereign immunity and its interaction with federalism principles.

Then book then explores the philosophy of the rule of law, a major component of which is the idea that
government is itself limited by the law and must stay within law's bounds to retain its legitimacy. Particularly
in a society like that of the United States, where a formal constitution creates and defines the government, its
powers and its limitations, the clash between sovereign immunity and the rule of law is unavoidable. The
Constitution has no function other than to define, empower, and limit the government. When the courts
invoke sovereign immunity to shield government or its agents from the consequences of violation of
constitutional norms, the rule of law and the basic fabric of society suffer.

This book intends to reach constitutional law and federal courts scholars, political scientists, historians, and
students of political philosophy.
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From reader reviews:

Louise Graham:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you
need something to explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual?
If you don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And
you have time? What did you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question
since just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Sovereign Immunity Or The Rule Of
Law: New Federalism's Choice to read.

Marilyn Vance:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or info even knowledge to make
these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe may
update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This Sovereign Immunity Or The Rule Of Law:
New Federalism's Choice is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Michael Jones:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Sovereign Immunity Or The Rule Of Law: New
Federalism's Choice can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are and so out of date,
spending your time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have
than the others?

Judy Sigmund:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got learners? We believe that that concern was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And also you know
that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important in addition to book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to incorporate you knowledge,
except your own teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Numerous
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra Sovereign Immunity Or The Rule Of Law:
New Federalism's Choice.
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