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An original novel set in the universe of Star Trek: Deep Space Nine—a direct sequel to the New York Times
bestselling story arc, The Fall!

The entire sector is waiting to see what the newly reopened Bajoran wormhole will mean for the shifting
political landscape in the Alpha Quadrant. On Deep Space 9, Captain Ro Laren is suddenly drawn into the
affairs of the People of the Open Sky, who have come to the station in search of sanctuary. Despite the
opposition of the station's security officer, Jefferson Blackmer, Ro Laren and Deep Space 9's new CMO,
Doctor Beverly Crusher, offer the People aid. But when Dr. Crusher’s highly secure files are accessed
without permission—the same files that hold the secrets of the Shedai, a race whose powerful but half-
understood scientific secrets solved the Andorian catastrophe—the People seem the likeliest suspects.

As tensions rise on the station, the science vessel Athene Donald arrives as part of its journey of exploration.
The brainchild of Doctor Katherine Pulaski, this ship is crewed by different species from the Khitomer
Accords and the Typhon Pact. Pulaski’s hope is that science will do what diplomacy has not: help the great
powers put aside their hostilities and work together. But when the Athene Donald is summarily stopped in
her voyage by the powerful vessel of a hitherto unknown species, Pulaski begins to wonder—will this first
contact bring her crew together or tear them all apart?

™, ®, & © 2014 CBS Studios, Inc. STAR TREK and related marks are trademarks of CBS Studios, Inc. All
Rights Reserved.
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From reader reviews:

Max Norris:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone at everywhere. The
information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider when those
information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable resource then you
understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen inside you if you take Star Trek: Deep Space Nine: The Missing as your daily resource
information.

Pedro Engle:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to share
the information or maybe their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you examining a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this Star Trek: Deep Space Nine: The Missing, it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon
about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a book.

Larry Murray:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Star Trek: Deep Space
Nine: The Missing, you can enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.

Marva Larson:

A lot of reserve has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by internet on social media. You
can choose the very best book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named
of book Star Trek: Deep Space Nine: The Missing. Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that,
you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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