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As author of the bestselling Why People Believe Weird Things and How We Believe, and Editor-in-Chief of
Skeptic magazine, Michael Shermer has emerged as the nation's number one scourge of superstition and bad
science. Now, in The Borderlands of Science, he takes us to the place where real science (such as the big
bang theory), borderland science (superstring theory), and just plain nonsense (Big Foot) collide with one
another.
Shermer argues that science is the best lens through which to view the world, but he recognizes that it's often
difficult for most of us to tell where valid science leaves off and borderland science begins. To help us,
Shermer looks at a range of topics that put the boundary line in high relief. For instance, he discusses the
many theories of everything that try to reduce the complexity of the world to a single principle, and shows
how most fall into the category of pseudoscience. He examines the work of Darwin and Freud, explaining
why one is among the great scientists in history, while the other has become nothing more than a historical
curiosity. He also shows how Carl Sagan's life exemplified the struggle we all face to find a balance between
being open-minded enough to recognize radical new ideas but not so open-minded that our brains fall out.
And finally, he reveals how scientists themselves can be led astray, as seen in the infamous Piltdown Hoax.
Michael Shermer's enlightening volume will be a valuable aid to anyone bewildered by the many scientific
theories swirling about. It will help us stay grounded in common sense as we try to evaluate everything from
SETI and acupuncture to hypnosis and cloning.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Gunter:

The book The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense Meets Nonsense can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So why must we leave the great thing like a book
The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense Meets Nonsense? Some of you have a different opinion about
publication. But one aim which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to
closer with your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share
all of these. Book The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense Meets Nonsense has simple shape nevertheless,
you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous world by open up and read
a book. So it is very wonderful.

Noah Gardner:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what you problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have
spare time to do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have spare time?
What did you do? Everybody has many questions above. They should answer that question due to the fact
just their can do this. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is right. Because
start from on pre-school until university need this The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense Meets Nonsense
to read.

Bonnie Parker:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when compared with
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find book that need more
time to be learn. The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense Meets Nonsense can be your answer given it can
be read by anyone who have those short free time problems.

Regina Hash:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you are
related is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of
several books in the top checklist in your reading list is usually The Borderlands of Science: Where Sense
Meets Nonsense. This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in getting
precious person. By looking way up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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